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Abstract: The controversy surrounding the teaching of sex 

education has oscillated the biosphere over with different schools 
of thoughts imposing their attitudes and perception in the 
direction of sex and the teaching of the same with little, if any 
thoughtfulness of the views and needs of adolescence in dynamic 
humanity and society. This dynamism has disseminated divergent 
observation ranging from conservative to liberal thought. 
Consequently, the youth has been left at intersections regarding 
questions of sexuality with no choice but to scavenge for 
information on sex from their peers, writings, the media and other 
sources, as others rather than themselves debate their destiny. It 
is in this light that this study scrutinized students’’ perception 
towards sex education in Kibaha district. Particularly, the study 
pursued to establish what perceptions of sex education is being 
held by students from various socio-cultural backgrounds, to 
determine students’ knowledge about sex education and to identify 
students’ sources of knowledge in sex education. This study 
employed social judgment theory (SJT) as projected by Sherif and 
Hovland (1961). The study used descriptive research design, where 
by quantitative approach was utilized. The study sample was 95 
respondents who were randomly selected. Data collection method 
used was close ended questionnaires. The research findings show 
that students had knowledge on topics such as contraception, 
sexually transmitted infections (STIs), consent, and sexual 
orientation. The results showed that while the students had some 
knowledge on these topics, there were gaps in their understanding, 
particularly around consent and sexual orientation. From these 
results, it can be concluded that while students have some 
knowledge of sex education, there are significant gaps in their 
understanding. These gaps can lead to misconceptions, which can 
have significant consequences, such as unintended pregnancies, 
STIs, and sexual assault. Other findings of this study suggest that 
family structure may not be a significant factor in shaping student 
perceptions of sex education. Therefore, it is important for 
educational institutions to take a more inclusive and responsive 
approach to sex education, which takes into account the diversity 
of family structures among students. By doing so, educational 
institutions can ensure that all students have access to high-quality 
sex education programs that are tailored to their specific needs 
and circumstances. Finally, a researcher presented some of the 
suggestions based on the findings of the study, sex education 
programs should start at an early age, with age-appropriate 
information provided at each stage of development, this will 
ensure that students have a comprehensive understanding of sex 
education and can build on this knowledge as they grow older.  Sex 
education programs should cover a broad range of topics,  

 
including contraception, STIs, consent, and sexual orientation, this 
will help to address the gaps in knowledge identified in the study 
and ensure that students have a comprehensive understanding of 
these topics. 
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1. Introduction 
Sexuality is a central aspect of being human throughout life, 

and sex education is expected to give people the knowledge and 
skills they need for a life time of good sexual health.  Many 
students and even grown-ups are uncomfortable with the clue 
of ‘adolescent sexuality’, and prefer to remain in unfamiliarity 
or denial, at the same time Global data indicates that 120 million 
young individuals engage in premarital sexual intercourse 
without any protection and unsafe abortions (UNICEF, 2001; 
Avert 2009). Beholding at pregnancy alone, the records show 
that each year around the globe women carry 75 million 
unwanted pregnancies (WHO, 2006). Despite the fact that 
sexual education is of great importance, still most of 
Tanzanians’ views on this subject are usually channeled 
through the media in form of letters to the editors of various 
local magazines, radio and television programmes, and some of 
religious leaders. Children and parents find it uncomfortable 
having a conversation about sex because the subject is a taboo 
in most homes as well as in schools.  

The numbers of teenagers who engage in early sexual 
relations has increased and sexual activity in teenagers could be 
viewed as a normal developmental behaviour. The age at 
marriage is increasing while the age at which puberty begins is 
decreasing so that the current age range for attainment of 
puberty is 9 to 14 years for boys and 8 to 13 for girls. The 
widening gap between the age at which puberty begins and the 
normal age of marriage increases the possibility of adolescents 
engaging in premarital sexual activity (Roque & Gubhaju, 
2001). A study conducted in England amid 1985 and 1998 
presented that a total of 71, 680 births, 5,398 occurred in 
adolescent mothers (Holgate, 2007). Yet again in New Zealand, 
Woodward, Fergusson and Horwood (2001) acknowledged that 
before the age of 20, approximately a quarter of the sampled 
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girls had been pregnant at least once, with the majority of 
pregnancies occurring between the ages of 17 and 20. Data from 
Sub - Saharan Africa point out that there is a high frequency of 
adolescent pregnancies. At Mbabane Government hospital in 
Swaziland, for instance, the data show that 25 percent of 
deliveries were by women aged between 10 and 19 (Mngadi, 
Zwane, Ahlberg & Ransjo – Arvidson, 2003). As a result of 
high rates of sexual activity and high-risk behaviors teen agers 
are exposed to unwanted outcomes, including sexually 
transmitted infections, unintended pregnancy and its 
consequences (WHO,1998; Edgardh, 2000; Diclemente et al., 
2001; Vunduleet al., 2001). 

What appears in the press and in a real situation indicates that 
Tanzanian have mixed feelings and perceptions regarding sex 
education and it being introduced in the school curriculum. In 
view of the above, there was a need to carry out the research in 
order to find out what perceptions of sex education are held by 
secondary school students in Kibaha district. 

2. Research Objectives 

A. General Objective 
The main objective of this study is to determine the 

perception of students towards sex education in Kibaha District. 

B. Specific Objectives 
i. To determine students’ knowledge about sex 

education. 
ii. To identify students’ sources of knowledge in sex 

education. 
iii. To establish what perceptions of sex education is 

being held by students from various socio-cultural 
backgrounds. 

3. Research Methodology  
The current study used the descriptive research design, 

Omari (2011) defines research design as an arrangement of 
condition for collection and analysis of data in such a way that 
aims to combine relevance of the research purpose with 
economy or is a plan for doing research, this designed was 
employed because it enabled the calculation of frequencies, 
percentages and statistical data and it was reliable in gathering 
a large amount of data. Thus, it enabled a research study to 
determine and explore the perception of students on Sex 
education. . The study was conducted at Kibaha district which 
is one among the seven districts of the Coast region (Pwani). 
The target population for this study was form three students of 
public and private secondary schools that were randomly 
selected for the study. The sample selected was 95 students, 
among which 49 were male and 46 were female. Data analysis 
was done quantitatively where by data were sorted, organized 
and coded for analysis. On the other hand, ethical issues during 
data collection were properly handled. 

4. Study Findings and Discussion 

A. To Determine Students’ Knowledge About Sex Education 
The first specific objective of the study was to determine the 

students’ knowledge about sex education. The results presented 
in Figure 1 determine students’ knowledge about sex education 
on different aspects.  

 

 
Fig. 1.  Students’ knowledge about sex education 

Source: Field survey, 2023 
 

1) Students’ Knowledge on HIV/AIDS 
According to the research findings, 98.9% of students are 

familiar with HIV/AIDS. This is a positive outcome as 
HIV/AIDS is a serious health issue that can have devastating 
consequences if left untreated. It is encouraging to see that 
almost all students are aware of this topic, although this finding 
is inconsistent with URT (2004, 2005) that found that apart 
from that the provision of sexuality education which is currently 
going on seem to be not addressing the focused intention which 
aim at giving pupils better information regarding the dangers of 
early sexual relationships, as well as providing accurate 
information about pregnancy, AIDS and other sexually 
transmitted diseases. 
2) Students’ knowledge on sexually transmitted diseases 

The research findings also indicate that 96.8% of students are 
familiar with sexually transmitted diseases (STDs). This is 
another positive outcome as STDs can have serious health 
consequences, including infertility, and can be easily prevented 
through the use of condoms and other safe sex practices. The 
high percentage of students who are familiar with this topic 
shows that sex education programs in secondary schools are 
effective in educating students about the risks associated with 
unprotected sex. This findings agrees with Henry J. Kaiser 
Family Foundation (2004) who found that Adolescents who 
have the training from schools and societies and who are able 
to control themselves from the use of drugs and alcohol could 
less likely be at risk of STDs and for that matter the relation 
between school instruction and organization of sexual and 
reproductive health issues influences the knowledge level of 
students thereby affecting their behaviour relative to better and 
safer sex practices that limit their vulnerability to HIV/AIDS, 
adolescent pregnancies and other STI‟s. 
3) Students’ knowledge on contraceptives 

The research findings show that only 24.2% of students are 
familiar with contraceptives. This is a concerning result as 
contraceptives are an important tool for preventing unwanted 
pregnancies and reducing the risk of contracting STDs. The low 
percentage of students who are familiar with contraceptives 
suggests that there is a need for improved sex education 
programs in secondary schools that focus on this topic. This 
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conclusion is inconsistent with research conducted by Entonu 
& Agwale., (2007) who postulated that adolescent males and 
females who have had sexual intercourse had knowledge to use 
condoms in their maiden sexual encounter. 
4) Students’ knowledge on abortion 

The research findings show that only 14.7% of students are 
familiar with abortion. This is a concerning result as abortion is 
a controversial issue that can have significant psychological and 
emotional consequences for those who undergo the procedure. 
The low percentage of students who are familiar with this topic 
suggests that there is a need for improved sex education 
programs in secondary schools that address this important issue. 
5) Students’ knowledge on reproduction 

The research findings show that 68.4% of students are 
familiar with reproduction. This is a positive outcome as 
reproduction is an important aspect of sexual health and 
responsible sexual behavior. It is encouraging to see that a high 
percentage of students are aware of this topic, which indicates 
that sex education programs in secondary schools are effective 
in educating students about the basics of human reproduction. 
6) Students’ knowledge on responsible sexual behavior 

The research findings show that only 26.3% of students are 
familiar with responsible sexual behavior. This is a concerning 
result as responsible sexual behavior is an important aspect of 
sexual health and can help prevent unwanted pregnancies and 
the spread of STDs. According to UNESCO (1999) in some 
parts of Africa 40% of 15year old young men and women have 
experienced sexual intercourse whereas in some parts of south 
East Asia over 80% of 20year old are still virgins. Research 
findings by AMREF in a study of Kenyan Secondary School 
girls put the average age at first coitus at 14.7 years. PCA’s 
survey showed that 64% of the Kenyan youth disapprove of 
premarital sex. When this is the case why is it that the youth 
still engage in the same practice? Watson and Brazer (2000) 
there are good reasons to ensure that the youth are well 
informed about their sexuality at home in the streets, in school 
and through the media. The young people today are increasing 
exposed to a variety of challenges and the low percentage of 
students who are familiar with this topic suggests that there is a 
need for improved sex education programs in secondary 
schools that focus on promoting responsible sexual behavior. 
7) Students’ knowledge on boy/girl relationships 

The research findings show that 50.5% of students are 
familiar with boy/girl relationships. This is a positive outcome 
as relationships are an important aspect of sexual health and can 
have a significant impact on a person's emotional well-being. 
Republic of Kenya (1994) as a significant and growing body of 
research relating to the behavior of Kenyan adolescents clearly 
indicates that many young people are not making responsible 
decisions about family life issues which have immediate and 
serious repercussion upon their health and welfare. Karanja 
(2004) found that, Sexual relationship between boys and girls 
begins very early in the life cycle and by age 16. To intervene 
effectively in a moment of sex related risk to prevent all its 
evils, it is essential to understand what is happening in 
particular the youth’s intentions, interests and the possible 
outcomes. Greater emphasis needs to be given to the ways in 

which young people understand their social and physical worlds 
and to the social and cultural processes that help them sense of 
sexual desires, feelings and interests (UNICEF 1994).  
8) Students’ knowledge on puberty/adolescence 

The research findings show that 45.3% of students are 
familiar with puberty/adolescence. This is a positive outcome 
as puberty and adolescence are important stages of 
development that can have a significant impact on a person's 
sexual health and behavior. It is encouraging to see that almost 
half of the students are aware of this topic, which indicates that 
sex education programs in secondary schools are effective in 
educating students about the physical and emotional changes 
that occur during puberty and adolescence. The report of the 1st 
inter African conference on adolescent health in Sub-Saharan 
Africa held in Nairobi noted that Sexual activity begins early 
among adolescents. Nearly eight out of ten of the youth had 
sexual relations before 20 years of age survey by KDHS (1998), 
a finding which was not reflected in policy interventions not in 
programme development for young people. Over again, 
Karanja (2004) found that teenage premarital sex has been 
attached to factors like type of school found that the highest 
dropout rates was found in ‘Harambee' secondary schools, 
which also tend to be mixed day schools. Dropout rates were 
highest in the exit classes (Std 8 and form 4) and dropouts 
tended to be older than their classmates and had poorer 
academic records. 

In conclusion, sex education is an important aspect of 
education that aims to provide students with information about 
sexual health and responsible sexual behavior. The research 
findings indicate that students are generally familiar with some 
sex-related topics, such as HIV/AIDS and sexually transmitted 
diseases. However, the findings also suggest that there is a need 
for improved sex education programs in secondary schools that 
focus on important topics such as contraceptives, abortion, and 
responsible sexual behavior.  

B. Students’ Sources of Knowledge in Sex Education 

 
Fig. 2.  Students’ sources of knowledge in sex education 

Source: Field survey, 2023 
 

The second objective aimed to identify Students’ sources of 
knowledge in sex education. Based on the data provided shows 
that, the most common sources of sex education for students 
are: 
1) Friends and schoolmates  

Friends and schoolmates by (20%). This finding agrees with 
(Njau 1992 & UNESCO 2002)) who found out that peers were 
the primary sources of information for other teenagers on all 
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sexual matters. In addition, Akinyi (1987) in her study of Kitale 
Municipality found out that most information on reproduction, 
contraceptives and venereal diseases was obtained sorely for 
friends. Njue (2003) noted that teenagers are continually 
exposed to many environmental influences in the changing 
society such as multi-media material, books, magazines, and 
films. All this is so easily accessible in the streets and at home. 
He further observed that Many times these sources provide false 
and unclear pictures of sex and morals. However, parents and 
guardians not being aware of environmental influences on 
youth get confused by the teenagers’ behaviors. Some have no 
background knowledge on expected behavior of teenager others 
are too shy to talk about it because they themselves grew up 
treating the whole of sex as a sensitive untalked about topic. 
Consequently, the youth are left groping for information from 
all clandestine sources. 
2) Radio/TV and newspaper/magazine/novel  

Another source was Radio/TV and newspaper/magazine/ 
novel by 16.7% each, this is consistent with the findings by 
Karanja (2004). Whereby the findings depicted that despite the 
great majority of students getting information from the 
television, radio, novels and magazines these sources were not 
preferred. Students may have consulted them due the fact that 
they are easily accessible and available. There is therefore a 
need to drift from the conventional methods and a more 
inclusive and relevant approach be adopted that will take 
advantage of the strengths of these sources available that 
captures the students’ attention. 
3) Classroom instruction and counseling teachers 

Classroom instruction and counseling teachers are also 
significant sources of sex education by 17.8%, Classroom 
instruction and counseling teachers, on the other hand, may 
have more formal training and expertise in providing sex 
education, but their ability to provide comprehensive and 
inclusive information may be limited by cultural or political 
barriers or lack of resources. That is true as the study conducted 
by Bilinga and Mabula (2014) found that 75% of the 
interviewed teachers from urban and rural areas respectively 
acknowledged to have not attended any specific training in 
sexuality education and that they need intensive training which 
can be in terms of seminar or short course so as to improve the 
skill they obtained from their professional training which is 
inadequate. They emphasized that, the specific training can help 
them to be clear and confident on information that they had to 
pass on to pupils, so that they would be able to answer any 
questions that may be asked by the pupils, as they needed 
correct information to make informed decisions about sex at 
this early stage of life.  Family (10%), church (8.4%), 
clinics/hospitals/doctors (10%), and public posters and 
handouts are less commonly used sources (11.1%). 

This data suggests that students are more likely to turn to 
their peers and popular media for information about sex and 
sexuality, rather than seeking out formal educational resources 
or seeking guidance from trusted adults such as teachers and 
parents. This may reflect a lack of confidence in the quality or 
reliability of formal sex education, or a desire for more informal 
and peer-driven learning experiences. This conclusion is 

consistent with a study conducted concerning sources of sex 
information to adolescents on sex education by Ramsey, 
(1989), Thornburg, (1981) and Harris and Davis, (1982) that 
were consistent with each other. A greater asserted that 
proportion of sex education information learnt by students were 
not given by parents, family members and also from teachers 
but was obtained from peers. Some information was also 
received from experience, physicians and the church. Boys 
were more dependent on peers and the girls on parents for their 
sex information. The fathers were an insignificant source of 
information for both boys and girls on sex education. Republic 
of Kenya (1994) report observed that the commonest source of 
information on sexuality among Kenyan adolescents are said to 
be friends, books magazines and teachers parents and churches 
play insignificant roles.  

 It is worth noting that the data does not provide information 
about the effectiveness or accuracy of these different sources of 
sex education, nor does it indicate whether students feel 
adequately informed about sexual health and relationships. 
Further research would be needed to assess the impact of 
different sources of sex education on student knowledge, 
attitudes, and behaviors in this area.  

C. Student Discussant Concerning Issues of Sex  
Table 1 

The student discussant concerning the issues of sex 
Persons Yes No 
Parent 41.1% 58.9% 
Your Girl Friend/Boy friend 88.4% 11.6% 
Your teacher counselor 49.4% 50.6% 
Your classroom teacher 26.3% 73.7% 
Grandparent 71.6% 28.4% 

                 Source: Field Survey, 2023 
 
The study hunted to ascertain the discussant of the student 

concern the issues of sex education. The survey asked students 
to indicate which individuals they had discussed sex education 
with and the frequency of these conversations. The results of 
the survey showed that: 
1) Parents  

Parents were the less common individuals that students 
discussed sex education with, with 41.1% of students indicating 
that they had spoken to their parents about sex. These findings 
are consistent with other studies where many parents do not 
believe that sexuality education can help young people make 
responsible decisions about sexual behaviour and sexual health 
(Dejong et al., 2007). Sathe, (1992) observed that, parents were 
uncomfortable about imparting sex education to their 
daughters. To them, sex education should be imparted to girls 
only after attaining menarche. Kodagoda, (1986) found out in 
another study in Sri Lanka that, some mothers were reluctant to 
talk about sex to their daughters as they found it embarrassing 
to discuss these issues. Some felt their children would become 
smart and may experiment with sex. A study conducted in 
Ghana by Kumi-Kyereme et al, (2000), showed that young 
people are reluctant to discuss sexuality with their parents since 
they tend to prefer to discuss these issues with their friends, 
because they feel shy, and also because they may fear physical 
punishment for discussing sexuality. The fear of physical 
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punishment or blame was even said to deter reporting to parents 
that unwanted sex had occurred Ampofo, (2016). Another 
group was of the opinion that such information could be got 
from friends, elder sister and sister-in-laws rather than the 
mothers. In a study by Poulsen et al, (2010), found that parents 
thought that talking about sexuality to their children encourages 
sex hence they will not talk about it at all. This finding is 
inconsistent with previous research that has shown that parents 
play a critical role in sex education, a study by Henry J. Kaiser 
Family Foundation, and Kennedy School of Government 
(2004). Asserted that Parents and other adults overwhelmingly 
support making sexuality education part of junior high and high 
school curricula.  
2) Girlfriend/Boyfriend 

This study also found that 88.4% of students had discussed 
sex education with their girlfriend/boyfriend. While this may 
seem like a high percentage, it is important to note that 
discussions about sex with romantic partners can be incomplete 
or inaccurate, and may not provide students with the 
information they need to make informed decisions about their 
sexual health.  
3) Teacher or Counselor  

Only 49.4% of students had discussed sex education with a 
teacher or counselor. This finding is concerning, as teachers and 
counselors are trained professionals who can provide accurate 
information about sex education and support students in making 
informed decisions about their sexual health. Similarly, only 
26.3% of students had discussed sex education with their 
classroom teacher. This finding suggests that sex education is 
not being adequately integrated into classroom curricula, which 
could lead to a lack of comprehensive and accurate information 
about sex education for students. 
4) Grandparents 

Grandparents were the second most common individuals that 
students discussed sex education with, by 71.6% of students 
indicating that they had spoken to their grandparents about sex. 
This finding is interesting, as grandparents may not be the first 
individuals that come to mind when thinking about sex 
education. However, it highlights the importance of having 
multiple trusted adults that students can turn to for information 
about sex education. 

5. Summary and Conclusion 
The study has been taken with the main objective of 

determining the perceptions of students in Kibaha District 
towards sex education. The study guided by three specific 
objectives namely’: students’ knowledge about sex education; 
students’ sources of knowledge in sex education; and 
perceptions of sex education being held by students from 
various socio-cultural backgrounds. 95 students from Kibaha 
district secondary school were included in the study. The 
descriptive analysis and t test were used to analyze the data by 
using SPSS software.  

The study found that there is moderate knowledge on sex 
education among the students. The participants were asked a 
series of questions related to sex education, including topics 
such as contraception, sexually transmitted infections (STIs), 

consent, and sexual orientation. The results showed that while 
the students had some knowledge on these topics, there were 
gaps in their understanding, particularly around consent and 
sexual orientation. From these results, it can be concluded that 
while students have some knowledge of sex education, there are 
significant gaps in their understanding. These gaps can lead to 
misconceptions, which can have significant consequences, such 
as unintended pregnancies, STIs, and sexual assault. Therefore, 
it is essential to improve sex education programs to ensure that 
students have a comprehensive understanding of these topics. 

In addition to the findings mentioned earlier, it is important 
to note that the quality and content of sex education can vary 
widely across different sources. For example, while radio/TV 
and newspapers/magazines/novels may be popular sources of 
information for students, the information presented through 
these media may not always be accurate, comprehensive, or 
age-appropriate. The data also highlights the limited role of 
family, church, clinics/hospitals/doctors, and public posters and 
handouts as sources of sex education for students. This may 
reflect a lack of access to these resources, or reluctance among 
parents, religious leaders, and healthcare providers to discuss 
sexuality with young people. This research study provides 
valuable insights into the individuals that students discuss sex 
education with. While peers and grandparents are important 
sources of information about sex education, there is a need for 
more support from teachers and counselors. To improve sex 
education outcomes for young people, there is a need for 
comprehensive sex education that involves multiple trusted 
adults and is integrated into classroom curricula. . 

Research on sex education has shown that discussions about 
sex with parents, teachers, and other trusted adults can 
positively impact young people's sexual health outcomes. 
Therefore, it is essential to examine the percentage of 
individuals who discuss sex education with students to 
understand how prevalent these conversations are. 

The results of this survey highlight the need for 
comprehensive sex education that involves multiple trusted 
adults, including parents, teachers, and counselors. While 
parents were the less common individuals that students 
discussed sex education with, there is a need for more support 
from other trusted adults, particularly teachers and counselors. 
The low percentage of students who had discussed sex 
education with their classroom teacher suggests that sex 
education is not being adequately integrated into classroom 
curricula. This finding is consistent with previous research that 
has shown that many teachers feel unprepared to teach sex 
education and may not have the necessary resources to do so 
effectively. 

6. Recommendations 
Based on the study's findings, some recommendations can be 

made to improve sex education programs. Firstly, sex education 
programs should start at an early age, with age-appropriate 
information provided at each stage of development. This will 
ensure that students have a comprehensive understanding of sex 
education and can build on this knowledge as they grow older. 
Secondly, sex education programs should cover a broad range 
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of topics, including contraception, STIs, consent, and sexual 
orientation. This will help to address the gaps in knowledge 
identified in the study and ensure that students have a 
comprehensive understanding of these topics. It is also essential 
to ensure that sex education programs are inclusive, covering 
different sexual orientations and gender identities. Thirdly, sex 
education programs should be evidence-based, with accurate 
and up-to-date information provided to students. This will 
ensure that students have a comprehensive understanding of 
these topics, based on the latest research and best practices. 
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